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THE SPIRITUAL SEASONS OF LIFE 
 
Elder Yashah, to all the family of YAH our Father and Yah’shua our Redeemer, Greetings. 
 
Beloved children, as we approach the spring harvest, let us reflect on the fact that our GOD created 
the four seasons of the year as a fixed cycle; not just in the physical world, but also in the Spirit! 
According to His grand design, the natural seasons are a reflection of the spiritual seasons of life. 
And the Feast Days of Yisrael are His eternal holy appointments, set to bless His elect according 
to the yearly cycle. But even though we all live through the same seasons, we don’t all live in the 
same locations. And notice, family, that the climates we live in within each season are often totally 
different... 
 
For example, in the winter months, the saints in New York City live in a very cold and bitter 
climate. But during that same season, saints in Los Angeles live for the most part, in mild, sunny 
weather. And likewise, in the summer months, those of us who live in the Mojave desert 
experience blistering one-hundred-degree plus heat. But in the same season, the saints who live 
less than a hundred miles away in the L.A. basin enjoy pleasant, comfortable weather! 
 
Thankfully for all of us, through the years, we also share the same cycle of spiritual seasons 
together, according to the plan and purpose of Almighty YAH. But again, due to our various levels 
of faith and obedience, we don’t always share the same spiritual climate. Just like we live in 
different cities and on different levels in the natural, our exposure to bitter cold and extreme heat 
in the Spirit is due to where we are in Christ within the seasons and appointments of YAH. 
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Behold, children: like the seasonal options of the financially rich, those among us who are wealthy 
in the Spirit are able to relocate during the uncomfortable seasons – but to an inner place of peace 
and righteousness; a place ‘flowing with milk and honey,’ where life-producing climates exist, 
even out of season! 
 
Beloved family, we must no longer divide ourselves with the idea that each of us have our own 
personal seasons. For as we all know, springtime is the season of new life, new harvest – and often 
new love – for all of us. And the summertime is that time of year when we all enjoy the sunny 
skies and outdoor activities of that season. And likewise, all of us share the colder climates and 
spiritual introspection of fall and winter… 
 
Now to be sure, we all live through various stages and phases of life, based upon our own numbers 
of  “evolutions” around the sun. And to that extent, each of our lives are totally unique. And 
certainly, the use of the word seasons as a metaphor for our individual stages is no sin. But again, 
through the ebb and flow of the yearly cycle, we do experience the seasonal climate changes in the 
Spirit as one Kingdom in Messiah Yah’shua. YAH Khai v’HalleluYAH! 
 
Surely, Yisrael, Almighty YAH has ordained the yearly cycle of life to unite His children as fellow 
sojourners, according to His seasonal Holy Days; to serve one another in love through Christ; in 
our Kingdom goal of growing in grace and truth unto the Everlasting Day. 
 
May the Grace, Mercy and Blessed Shal’m of Abba YAH be multiplied unto you all. ECHAD! 
 
IT’S KINGDOM TIME. 
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